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Manusmriti is a book of laws, authored by the earliest and the most authoritative Law-giver,
Bhagavan Manu. This book derives its authority from the Vedas and lays down rules of conduct and
procedures of rituals for individuals in different walks of life. Known also as Dharmasastra, this
unique book deals with human life right from birth to death. The word dharma (धर्म) means
righteousness or duty, justice, rule or duty. Its one of the six Amsas of Hinduism or Hindu religion.
Dharman implies a duty, a right. If there is any duty, there must be some one to whom it belongs.
That is the duty of a society to its members. Any act which is not in accordance with dharma is
considered as a sin. Dharman can be defined as one of the most important duties of the soul which is
taking care of the living. Devotees should help the weak with their spiritual knowledge. Those are
called the "great persons". Those who are born in the family of Dharmas (righteous men) have to
take care of the next generation. The foundation of the Hindu religion is based on the concept of
dharma. The word dharma which means righteousness or duty has six aspects: moral virtue, or
karmayajna, its the duty of a person to guide his life by his own action or karma. Dharma contains a
sense of right action, the means by which a person is fit for duties that tend to free him from future
bondage. Dharma is the duty one person towards another in any social unit. It is primarily the duty of
the king toward subjects. Dharma is basically the regular practice of the rules laid down in the holy
law books for living. Dharmas are fulfilled by doing actions in keeping with the law. Dharman implies
a duty, a right. If there is any duty, there must be some one to whom it belongs. That is the duty of a
society to its members. Any act which is not in accordance with dharma is considered as a sin.
Dharman can be defined as one of the most important duties of the soul which is taking care of the
living. Devotees should help the weak with their spiritual knowledge. Those are called the "great
persons". Those who are born in the family of Dharmas (righteous men) have to take care of the next
generation.
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I read most of the Manu Dharmashastra and have started reading it again. The full set is very long
and I feel that it is a bit difficult to understand the way it is written, for a lay person. His ideas about

the Chandalas have not been welcomed by the Hindu temple committees. Hence, no Temple
committee has ever included him among the list of Theuthas. Sir as i am persuing my Ph.D.. I am in
search of some references regarding Tantrabhushana concept which means the particular topic is
decorating or highly essential in the specific treatise. Could you extend your helping hands for this

work or guidance also do you know any sanskrit book on Chhandrashastra translated in hindi or
english which can be downloaded Thus the situation of women is seen as a consequence of their own

bad conduct. As a result of the Manu Dharmashastra, the woman is defined as a collection of
“women” with varying degrees of virtue, it becomes incumbent upon the woman to protect her

virtue in order to become complete as a human. The Manu Dharmashastra was celebrated
throughout the Indian subcontinent. Manu, however, is often considered as the most important, and
his legal views provided a model for later developments like the rules of marriage in medieval Hindu
law. Manu Dharmashastra is the scripture of the Hindus that address the issues of the world, society

and the society. Manu also enshrines in law the principles of the social order in the context of its
caste Hindu society. Through writings of ancient Indian sage Manu, the authority-based social

system is systematized and confirmed by the Hindu culture. The practice of Brahmanical Hinduism
can be characterised, as essentially a hierarchical social system similar to caste Hinduism, with its

associated legal principles and social organisation, that continued through the medieval and modern
periods. 5ec8ef588b
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